
 Joint School District No.2 
           1303 E. Central Drive, Meridian, Idaho 83642 Phone (208) 855-4500 Fax (208) 350-5962 
    SUPERINTENDENT 
     Dr. Linda Clark 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

DATE: May 7, 2008 
 
TO:  Dr. Linda Clark, Superintendent 
  Board of Trustees 
 
FROM:  Dennis Talbot, Purchasing Agent    
 
RE:  Bid results: Video Production Equipment 
_______________________________________________________________________ 
 
On May 6, 2008 bids were opened for the Rocky Mountain Instructional Video Production 
Equipment. A bid notice was posted and advertised according to state statutes and 
district policy. Bid packets were distributed via the internet and two (2) responses were 
received. A bid recap is attached.  
 
We recommend award to the low bidders as shown on the attached recap for a total of 
$53,769.00. The items for which there were no bids will be submitted for quotes or 
acquired through a cooperative purchasing agreement. 
 
This equipment will be purchased from the Vocational Technical budget for RMHS. 
 
 
Thank you. 
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 UNIT
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1 CAMERA SUPPORT BOGEN/
MANFROTTO

MODO 
STEADY
585

QUICK RELEASE ROTATING PLATE,QUICK RELEASE 
PLATE LOCKING KNOB, BI-INJECTED SOFT RUBBER 
HANDLE AND FEET

2 EA 224.00          448.00                              142.00          284.00                              

2 MULTI-FUNCTION 
TESTER WHIRLBOX QBOX AUDIO LINE TESTER / CABLE TESTER / TEST TONE 

GENERATOR 1 EA 2,189.00       2,189.00                           NO BID NO BID

3 LCD COMPUTER 
DISPLAY SAMSUNG SYNCMASTER

941BW WIDESCREEN, VGA/DVI-D 1 EA 289.00          289.00                              225.00          225.00                              

4 MICROPHONE BEHRINGER B-2 PRO CONDENSER STUDIO MODEL LARGE DIAPHRAGM, 
MULTI-PATTERN 1 EA 148.00          148.00                              140.00          140.00                              

5 AUDIO MIXER BEHRINGER XENYX 2222FX
22 CHANNEL, 2 BUS, WITH 24 BIT EFFECTS 
PROCESSOR, 8 MICROPHONE INPUTS, 16 LINE LEVEL 
INPUTS 4 SETS STEREO PARED

2 EA 278.00          556.00                              240.00          480.00                              

6 MICROPHONE STAND AKG KM238/5 TABLE MOUNTED SCISSOR STAND WITH 16' XLR MIC 
CABLE BLACK 1 EA 159.00          159.00                              142.00          142.00                              

7 MULTI-MEDIA 
PROJECTOR SHARP PG-F200X DLP XGA(1024X768) 2100 ANSI LUMENS 1 EA 679.00          679.00                              662.00          662.00                              

8 PROJECTION SCREEN DRAPER 207097
LUMA MANUAL 31.75"X56.5" (65" DIAGONAL) HDTV 
FORMAT (16:9 ASPECT RATIO) WITH 2 EA T-BAR TWIST 
CLIPS

HC GRAY (HIGH 
CONTRAST 1 EA 99.00            99.00                                115.00          115.00                              

9 RAIL SYSTEM BOGEN/
MANFROTTO FF3032

PRO STUDIO 32 KIT 2 FIXED, 1 MOBILE RAIL 9'10" EACH 
INCLUDING BRACKETS, CARRIAGES, SPIGOTS, END 
STOPS, AND TWO TELESCOPIC POLES TO SUPPORT 
TWO LIGHTS.

1 KIT 1,289.00       1,289.00                           1,025.00       1,025.00                           

10 FLOODLIGHTS SMITH-
VICTOR

KQ83 120-
240VAC

ULTRA QUARTZ TUNGSTEN 3 FLOODLIGHT KIT 1800 
TOTAL WATTAGE WITH 120V BULBS, UMBRELLAS, 
MOUNTS, STANDS AND WHEELED CASE

1 KIT 449.00          449.00                              295.00          295.00                              

11 ENGINEER'S TOOL KIT COMPA-
CABLE ETK-TD5 DELUXE FIELD ENGINEERS TOOL KIT (107 PIECES) 

WRENCHES, PLIERS, SCREWDRIVERS, ETC. 1 KIT 259.00          259.00                              NO BID NO BID

12 WIRELESS INTERCOM 
SYSTEM EARTEK TD 904 PRO FULL DUPLEX PORTABLE 4 STATION SYSTEM WITH 

PROLINE HEADSETS 1 SET 869.00          869.00                              675.00          675.00                              

13
WIRELESS 
MICROPHONE 
SYSTEM

AZDEN 500XT
CAMERA MOUNTED UHF HANDHELD SYSTEM TWO 
FLEXIBLE ANTENNAS, 63 USER SELECTABLE, CRYSTAL 
CONTROLLED, PLL-SYNTHESIZED UHF FREQUENCIES

1 SET 619.00          619.00                              534.00          534.00                              

14
WIRELESS 
MICROPHONE 
SYSTEM

AZDEN 111XTE3
111XT CAMERA MOUNTABLE VHF PLUG-IN SYSTEM 
WITH 111R RECEIVER AND 31 XT PLUG IN 
TRANSMITTER (CHANEL E3/196.800MHZ

1 SET 329.00          329.00                              305.00          305.00                              

15 LAVALIER 
MICROPHONE SHURE SM11-CN OMNI-DIRECTIONAL DYNAMIC 4 EA 99.00            396.00                              99.99            399.96                              

16 HANDHELD 
MICROPHONE SHURE VP64A OMNI-DIRECTIONAL DYNAMIC ENG 4 EA 77.00            308.00                              79.99            319.96                              

17 CAMCORDER SONY DVCRVX2100 12x OPTICAL/48x DIGITAL ZOOM, COLOR 
VIEWFINDER, 2.5" LCD SCREEN

2 EA 2,600.00       5,200.00                           2,370.00       4,740.00                           

18 STUDIO PEDESTAL PETER-
LISAND PLSP1 100MM BOWL CAPABLE OF SUPPORTING 50.0 LB. 2 EA 2,200.00       4,400.00                           NO BID NO BID

19 FLUID HEAD CARTONI F100 10MM BOWL, 22LB CAPACITY 2 EA 1,000.00       2,000.00                           932.00          1,864.00                           
20 CAMERA CONTROL VARIZOOM VZ-ROCK COMPACT FOR LANC CAMCORDERS 2.8"X2" 2 EA 249.00          498.00                              235.00          470.00                              

VENDOR→ INTEGRITY TRI-STATE
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21 CAMCORDER JVC GZ-HD7US
EVERIO 5 MEGAPIXEL 3CCD, 60GB HARD DRIVE 
1920X1080 HIGH DEFINITION 10X OPTICAL ZOOM, 
OPTICAL IMAGE STABILIZATION

8 EA 1,399.00       11,192.00                         1,449.00       11,592.00                         

22 CAMCORDER JVC GZ-MG330HUS
1/6" CCD IMAGE SENSOR,2.7" LCD. USB2.0, PICTBRIDGE 
COMPATIBLE, LASER TOUCH NAVIGATION, 30GB HARD 
DRIVE

SILVER 1 EA 449.00          449.00                              440.00          440.00                              

23 BATTERY PACK JVC BN-VF815 LITHIUM-ION, 2-HOUR 7.2V, 1460MAH 16 EA 67.00            1,072.00                           68.00            1,088.00                           
24 DESKTOP CHARGER IMPACT DPBCD FOR JVC/RCA 10VAC/12-24VDC 750MA 6 EA 89.00            534.00                              78.00            468.00                              
25 TRIPOD VELBON DV-7000 2-WAY FLUID HEAD, 9.92 LB. CAPACITY 8 EA 123.00          984.00                              129.00          1,032.00                           

26 STUDIO LIGHTING FLOLIGHT FB-440

BANK SELECTABLE LIGHT, 8 EA 55 WATT BIAX BULBS 
SELECTABLE 0,2,4,6,8 ON/OFF FOUR EACH FOUR WAY 
BARNDOORS WITH REMOVABLE REFLECTORS, 
REMOVABLE 10' POWER CORD

3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

27 NOTEBOOK 
COMPUTER APPLE MACBOOK 

PRO

2.4GHz Intel Core Duo, 2GB 667 DDR2 - 2x1GB S)-DIMMs 
160GB Serial ATA Drive @ 5400RPM, SuperDrive 8x 
(DVD±R DL/DVD±RW/CD-RW) MacBook Pro 17" 
Widescreen Display, Backlit Keyboard/Mac OS - English

15 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

28
EXTERNAL FIREWIRE-
800 CAPTURE 
DEVICE

AJA IOHD Analog/Digital Capture Device with Apple ProRes 422 2 EA NO BID NO BID 3,052.00       6,104.00                           

29 HOST ADAPTER CalDigit FASTA-1ex
1-Port ExpressCard/34
eSATA 3 Gb/s Host Adapter for MacBook Pro and 
Other Notebooks

15 EA NO BID NO BID 108.00          1,620.00                           

30 HARD DRIVE WESTERN 
DIGITAL

WDH1Q
10000N

USB 2.0 FIREWIRE-400 FIREWIRE 800 eSATA 
HFS+FORMATTED FOR MACINTOSH 15 EA NO BID NO BID 255.00          3,825.00                           

31
LIVE PRODUCTION 
STUDIO 
(EDUCATIONAL)

NewTek

All In One, Switcher, Titler, Keyer, Media Storage, 
Network (RJ-45), VGA (HD-15), Component, 
Composite (RCA), Y/C S-Video (4-Pin), USB, 
Unbalanced Audio (RCA), Balanced Audio (XLR)

1 EA 6,695.00       6,695.00                           9,295.00       9,295.00                           

32 DV/HDV 
RECORDER/PLAYER DATAVIDEO DN-300

RS-422 REMOTE CONTROLLABLE, DRAG &DROP, NTSC, 
250 GB HDD, MAC COMPATIBLE, LOOP PLAYBACK 
INPUTS, UP TO 19 HOURS OF VIDEO

1 EA 1,499.00       1,499.00                           1,265.00       1,265.00                           

33 DVD RECORDER SONY DVDirect MC5

Record video to DVD from DV or analog video source 
– Playable in most home DVD players, Record AVCHD 
video from Sony HDD/MemoryStick Handycam 
Camcorder to DVD playable in most Blu-ray Disc™ 
players,  Backup digital photos to DVD or create 
photo slideshow on DVD from Memory card or Sony 
HDD/Memory Stick Handycam camcorder via USB

1 EA 219.00          219.00                              230.00          230.00                              

34 DVD/VCR COMBO 
RECORDER JVC DR-MV77

HDMI, HD-Upscaling, Component, DV-In, Dolby 
Digital/DTS, DivX - Records to: DVD-R/W, DVD+R/W 
- 4-Head Stereo VCR w/SQPB

SILVER 1 EA 229.00          229.00                              235.00          235.00                              
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